2023-244E
BID COVER PAGE

City of Procurement Division

: - 352) 334-5021(mai
GalneSVllle Igsue)Date: 12/ 1(9/353

INVITATION TO BID: # PWDA-230027-DH
Pavement Management (Preservation & Surfacing) Continuing Services

PRE-BID MEETING: 0O Non-Mandatory O Mandatory X N/A 0O Includes Site Visit
DATE: TIME:
LOCATION:

QUESTION SUBMITTAL DUE DATE: January 23, 2023 @ 3:00 pm

All meetings and submittal deadlines are Eastern Time (ET).

DUE DATE FOR UPLOADING BID RESPONSE: January 30, 2023 at 3:00PM

SUMMARY OF SCOPE OF WORK:
Push button milling, asphalt surfacing, asphalt surface treating (crack seal, chip seal, scrub seal, micro-surfacing, cape
seal and asphalt rejuvenation), roadway base work, roadway concrete work and pavement marking services.

For questions relating to this bid, contact: Diane Holder , holderds@gainesvillefl.gov

Bidder is not in arrears to City upon any debt, fee, tax or contract: Bidder is NOT in arrears [] Bidder IS in arrears
Bidder is not a defaulter, as surety or otherwise, upon any obligation to City: K] Bidder is NOT in default [] Bidder IS in default

Bidders who receive this bid from sources other than City of Gainesville Procurement Division or DemandStar MUST contact the
Procurement Division prior to the due date to ensure any addenda are received in order to submit a responsible and responsive offer.
Uploading an incomplete document may deem the offer non-responsive, causing rejection.

ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGMENT: Prior to submitting my offer, I have verified that all addenda issued to date are considered as
part of my offer: Addenda received (list all) # 1 - 1/27/23

Legal Name of Bidder: V- E. Whitehurst & Sons, Inc.

PR, SEME

Jackson W. Whitehurst, Vice President

Authorized Representative Name/Title:
aburleson@vewhitehurst.com FEpN: 04-3619482

20551 NE 75th Street - Williston, FL 32696

E-mail Address:

Street Address:

Mailing Address (if different): Same
Telephone: (_352 ) 528-2101 Fax: (_352 ) 528-3857

By signing this form, I acknowledge I have read and understand, and my business complies with all General Condidons and requirements
set forth herein; and,

X Bid is in full compliance with the Specifications.

O Bid is in full compliance with specifications except as speciﬁcalystat d and attached W
SIGNATURE OF AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE: é{g[ 1 /M/ s
SIGNER’S PRINTED NAME: Jackson W. Whitehurst / DATE: 01/30/23

This page must be completed and uploaded to DemandStar.com with your Submittal.
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PART 4 - BID FORM

Pavement Management (Preservation & Surfacing) Continuing Services

Date: January 30, 2023

The bidder hereby declares that he has examined the site of the work and informed himself fully in regard to all conditions
pertaining to the place where the work is to be done, and that he has examined the plans, specifications, agreement and all
documents related to the above referenced solicitation for the work and comments hereto attached. The Bidder further declares
that the only persons, company or parties interested in this Bid or the Agreement to be entered into, as principals, are named
herein; that this Bid is made without connection with any other person, company or parties making a Bid; and it is in all respects

fair and in good faith and without collusion or fraud.

The Bidder proposes and agrees, if this Bid is accepted, to contract with City of Gainesville, Florida, through the City
Commission, , in the form of Agreement specified, to furnish all necessary materials, equipment, machinery, tools, apparatus,
means of transportation, labor and service necessary to complete the work covered by the Bid Solicitation for: Pavement
Management (Preservation & Surfacing) Continuing Services and to furnish the prescribed Performance and Payment Bond for

as required by the final agreement; and to furnish the required evidence of the specified insurance.
Attached is a list of similar projects and a list of Subcontractors as covered in the Instructions to Bidders.

The Bidder agrees to accept in full compensation for each item the prices named in the schedule incorporated herein and attached
as “Bid Schedule”. The Bidder understands that the quantities shown on the “Bid Schedule” are approximate only and subject
to increase or decrease. Should they be increased or decreased, work will be performed at the unit price bid herein. Actual

quantities will be determined upon completion of the work.

This page must be completed and uploaded with your Submittal.
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Pavement Management (Preservation & Surfacing) Continuing Services
4.1 BID FORM/PAY ITEM LIST

Quantities requested will be placed in a single Work Order for work zones throughout the City; a single mobilization will be paid per
treatment type per Work Order (crack seal, chip seal, micro-surfacing, etc). Once mobilized, the City will not require demobilization
or remobilization until Work Order is completed. After hours mark-up percentage will be applied if the City request work to be
performed nights, weekends and holidays and will be applied to each applicable pay item excluding mobilization. Each bidder shall
Sfully complete at least one part of the bid to be considered responsive.

Part 1 —Base Work

Type/Thickness | Unit 0100 101 - 1000 2’885 - ibog(l)()_ Over 10,000
Mobilization | LumpSum | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
Masus . |Percentie | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
e | e NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
2 Limerock | Square NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
O Limerock | Siuare NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
Bamerock | Siuare NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
by Lmerock | Sauare NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
Part 2 — Crack Seal
. 5,001 -
Crack Seal Unit 0-100 101 -1000 1,001 - 5,000 10.000 Over 10,000
Mobilization | LumpSum | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
Maiay | Percenage | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
Spec.305 | Gallons NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
Part 3 — Milling Asphalt Pavement
. 25,001 - 50,001 — 100,001 - Over

Depth Unit 0-25000 1 55000 100,000 250,000 250,000
Mobilization | LumpSum | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
Morus " | Percentage | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
0.25Inches | Square Yards |  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
0.50 Inches | Square Yards | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
0.75 Inches | Square Yards | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
100 Inches | Square Yards | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
125Inches | Square Yards | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid

This page must be completed and uploaded with your Submittal.
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R R Err i T
I.5Inches | Square Yards | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
1.75Inches | Square Yards | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
20Inches | Square Yards | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
2.25Inches | Square Yards | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
2.5Inches | Square Yards | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
275 Inches | Square Yards | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
3.0Inches | Square Yards | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
325Inches | Square Yards | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
35Inches | SquareYards | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid

Part 4 — Asphalt Pavement Placement
Type Unit 0-150 151 - 250 251 - 500 501 -1000 Over 1,000
Mobilization | Lump Sum 7,500 7,500 10,000 | 10,000 | 15,000
Mo | Percentage 20% 20% 20% 20% 20%
oo 1= | Tons 2,500.00 | 2,000.00 | 2,000.00 | 2,000.00 | 2,000.00
Soon = Tons 2,300.00 | 1,850.00 | 1,850.00 | 1,850.00 | 1,850.00
o2 | Tons 44745 | 196.25 | 185.26 | 185.26 | 185.26
SaO 2 | Tons 41553 | 18225 | 172.04 | 172.04 | 172.04
haeory 2~ | Tons 468.26 | 207.56 | 195.94 | 195.94 | 195.94
Caegoy 2~ | Ton 447.49 | 191.56 | 180.84 | 180.84 | 180.84
Category 2 —

P00 (PG | Tons 468.26 | 207.56 | 19594 | 19594 | 195.94
Category 2 —

SPI25 (PG | Tons 447.49 | 19156 | 180.84 | 180.84 | 180.84
Category 2 —

FC-9.5(PG | Tons 468.26 | 207.56 | 19594 | 19594 | 195.94
Category 7=

FCI2506 | Tons 447.49 | 19156 | 180.84 | 180.84 | 180.84
G 3 | Tons 435.60 | 186.83 | 183.69 | 183.69 | 183.69
Gaegory 3~ | Tons 42552 | 173.50 | 170.59 | 170.59 | 170.59
Caesory 3= | Ton 44252 | 197.60 | 194.48 | 19448 | 194.48
b0y 3 | Tons 439.98 | 18237 | 17930 | 179.30 | 179.30

This page must be completed and uploaded with your Submittal.
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Type Unit 0-150 151 - 250 251 - 500 501 -1000 Over 1,000
Category 3 —
SPOSEG | Tos 44252 | 197.60 | 194.48 | 194.48 | 194.48
76-
Category 3 —
SP-1250G | Tors 439.98 | 18237 | 179.30 | 179.30 | 179.30
76-22
Category 3 —
FOSS (G | Toms 44252 | 197.60 | 194.48 | 194.48 | 194.48
Category 3 —
PO PG | Tom 439.98 | 182.37 | 179.30 | 179.30 | 179.30
76-
Part 5 — Asphalt Pavement Pick-up Only
Type Unit 0-150 151 - 250 251 - 500 501 - 1000 Over 1,000
Mauy | Percentage 20% 20% 20% 20% 20%
$P-9.5 Tons 154.80 | 154.80 | 154.80 | 154.80 | 154.80
SP-125 | Tons 14370 | 143.70 | 14370 | 14370 | 143.70
FC9.5 Tons 163.75 | 163.75 | 163.75 | 163.75 | 163.75
FC-125 | Tons 15115 | 15115 | 15145 | 15115 | 151.15
Toony 0| Tons 163.75 | 163.75 | 163.75 | 163.75 | 163.75
2oy O | Tons 15115 | 15115 | 15145 | 15115 | 151.15
Soan O | Tons 163.75 | 163.75 | 163.75 | 163.75 | 163.75
Soan, €| Tons 15115 | 15115 | 15115 | 15115 | 151.15
Part 6 — Chip Seal
Chip Seal = | 10,000 — 25,001 — 50,001 — 100,001 — Over
Spec. 335-1 n 25,000 50,000 100,000 250,000 250,000
Mobilization | LumpSum | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
Qﬁfﬁfg““ Percentage NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
ongle | Sawarevads | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
onge | Saurevads | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
oowle | Squarevards | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
pouble | Square Yards | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
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Part 7 — Micro-Surfacing

g’fl':g’c'in | Unit 10,000 — 25,001 — 50,001 — 100,001 — Over
g 25,000 50,000 100,000 250,000 250,000
Spec. 335-2
Mobilization | Lump Sum No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
After-H . . . . .
Markeu | Percentage | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
-up
Single . . . . .
Conventional | Square Yards No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Single . . . . .
Premium Square Yards No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Double . . . . .
Conventional | Sauare Yards No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Double . . . . .
pone | SquareYards | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
Rut Filling | Unit 0— 150 151 - 250 251 —500 501 —1000 | Over 1,000
Conventional | Tons No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Premium Tons No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Part 8 — Asphalt Rejuvenation
ﬁi‘.’lll‘j:;aﬁon Unit 10,000 — 25,001 — 50,001 — 100,001 — Over
J 25,000 50,000 100,000 250,000 250,000
— Spec. 335-4
Mobilization | Lump Sum No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
After-H . . . : .
o O Percentage No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mark-up
Asphalt Square Yards | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
Rejuvenation
Asphalt
Rejuvenation | Square Yards No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
with TiO,
Part 9 —Rejuvenating Scrub Seal
Scrub — Unit 10,000 — 25,001 — 50,001 — 100,001 — Over
Spec. 335-5 25,000 50,000 100,000 250,000 250,000
Mobilization | Lump Sum No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
After-H . . . : .
© M| Percentage No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mark-up
Rejuvenating . . . . .
Scrub Seal Square Yards No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Part 10 —Concrete Work

Type Unit 0-150 151 - 250 251 -500 501 -1000 Over 1,000

Mobilization | Lump Sum No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Qﬁfﬂfﬁm Percentage NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid

4” Thick

Sidewalk & | Square Yards | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Driveways

6” Thick

Sidewalk & | Square Yards | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Driveways

8” Thick

Sidewalk & | Square Yards | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bus Stops

6” Thick

Concrete Square Yards | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Curb Ramps

Detectable

Warning Square Foot | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Surface

Type A Curb | Linear Foot | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type B Curb | Linear Foot | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type D Curb | Lincar Foot | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type E Curb | Linear Foot | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type F Curb | Linear Foot No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Drop Curb | Linear Foot | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Valley Gutter | Linear Foot No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Removal of

Existing Square Yards | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Concrete

Part 11 — Pavement Markings — (White or vellow if applicable)

Long Line Unit 0-5 5-10 10 -25 25-50 Over 50

6” Solid Paint | Gross Mile NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid

¢"Skip 10°30" | GrogsMile | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid

¢ Solid GrossMile | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid

¢ Skip 130" | GrosMile | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid

i,‘[‘pp'.eme“ta' Unit 0-150 151 - 250 251-500 | 5011000 | Over 1,000
arkings

fof}lg‘; Fant | inearFoot | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid

This page must be completed and uploaded with your Submittal.
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Supplemental

M . Unit 0-150 151 - 250 251 -500 501 -1000 Over 1,000

arkings

8" Solid Paint | Liner Foot NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
12” Solid Paint | Liner Foot NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
18” Solid Paint | Liner Foot NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid

24” Solid Paint | Liner Foot NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid

¢ Skip 610" ) GrossLiner | no Big | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid

¢"Skip 24 | GrossLiner | NoBig | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid

Saffp 39 ?;gfs Liner |\ NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid

6” Solid

Thermo LinearFoot | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid

(BLUE)

3 Sohd Liner Foot NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid

ﬁefﬁéld Liner Foot NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid

1 Sold Liner Foot NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid

2 Sold Liner Foot NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid

¢ Skip 010" | GrossLiner | N6 Big | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid

¢ Skip2-4 | GrossLiner | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid

?hf’rlf;? '9 l?éﬁfs Liner | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

EVP";;Z"“ Each NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid

pomanent Each NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid

vieldLines | SquarcFoot | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid

Speed

Hump/Speed | Square Foot | No Bid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid

Table Paint

Misc. Paint

(Bullnose, Squarc Foot | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid

Curb, Etc.)

yieldLines | squreFoot | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid

Speed

Hump/Speed | Square Foot | No Bid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid

Table Thermo

Misc. Thermo

(Bullnose, Squarc Foot | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid

Curb, Etc.)

g’lessages & | nit 0-5 6-10 11-25 26 - 50 Over 50
ymbols

pott (Message) | gach NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid

Right

(Message) Each NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid

Paint

This page must be completed and uploaded with your Submittal.
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Messages &

Unit 0-5 6-10 11-25 26 -50 Over 50
Symbols

Stop (Message)
Paint

Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Lane (4')
(Message) Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Paint

Only (4"
(Message) Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Paint

Only (8))
(Message) Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Paint

Lane (8"
(Message) Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Paint

Turn (Message)
Paint

Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Merge
(Message) Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Paint

Bus (Message)
Paint

Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

School
(Message) Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Paint

Railroad
(Message) Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Paint

Railroad (Bike
Path)
(Message)
Paint

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Each

Wrong Way

Arrow Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
(Symbol) Paint

(‘;;fnf:bpaim Each NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid

Thru Arrow

(Symbol) Paint Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Left or Right

Arrow Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
(Symbol) Paint

Left or Righ
T e NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
Arrow Each

(Symbol) Paint

Left, Right and

Thru Arrow Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
(Symbol) Paint

Bike Lane

Arrow Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
(Symbol) Paint

Helmeted

Bicyclist Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
(Symbol) Paint

Shared L
Marking NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid

(Symbol) Each
(Paint
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Messages &

Unit 0-5 6-10 11-25 26 -50 Over 50
Symbols

Accessibility
(3’) (Symbol) | Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Paint

Accessibility
(57) (Symbol) | Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Paint

Left (Message)
Thermo

Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Right
(Message) Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Thermo

Stop (Message)
Thermo

Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Lane (4")
(Message) Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Thermo

Only (4"
(Message) Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Thermo

Only (8"
(Message) Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Thermo

Lane (8")
(Message) Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Thermo

Turn (Message)
Thermo

Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Merge
(Message) Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Thermo

Bus (Message)
Thermo

Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

School
(Message) Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Thermo

Railroad
(Message) Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Thermo

Railroad (Bike
Path)
(Message)
Thermo

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Each

\\% W
Ao NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid

(Symbol) Each
Thermo

U-Turn
(Symbol) Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Thermo

Thru Arrow

(Symbol) Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Thermo

Left or Righ
oo et NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid

(Symbol) Each
Thermo

Left or Right
and Thru Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Arrow
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Messages &
Symbols

Unit

11-25

26-50

Over 50

(Symbol)
Thermo

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Left, Right and
Thru Arrow
(Symbol)
Thermo

Each

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Bike Lane
Arrow
(Symbol)
(Preformed
Only) Thermo

Each

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Helmeted
Bicyclist
(Symbol)
(Preformed
Only) Thermo

Each

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Shared Lane
Marking
(Symbol)
(Preformed
Only) Thermo

Each

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Accessibility
(3”) (Symbol)
Thermo

Each

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Accessibility
(5”) (Symbol)
Thermo

Each

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Removal —
Grinding

Unit

0-150

151 - 250

251 -500

501 -1000

Over 1,000

Mobilization

Lump Sum

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Painted
Symbols and
Messages

Square Foot

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Painted Stripe

Square Foot

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Thermoplastic
Symbols and
Messages

Square Foot

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Thermoplastic
Stripe

Square Foot

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Removal —
Water
Blasting

Unit

0-150

151 - 250

251 -500

501 -1000

Over 1,000

Mobilization

Lump Sum

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Painted
Symbols and
Messages

Square Foot

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Painted Stripe

Square Foot

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Thermoplastic
Symbols and
Messages

Square Foot

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Thermoplastic
Stripe

Square Foot

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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ﬁ/{f;ill;l;llgurs Percentage No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

List of Unit Abbreviations:

SY Square Yards GL Gallons SD Side Drain

LS Lump Sum MG Thousand Gallons ED Each Day

CY Cubic Yards GM Gross Miles CD Cross Drain

EA Each LF Linear Feet AC Acre

TN Tons NM Net Miles RCP Reinforced Concrete Pipe
HR Hour AS  Assembly PI  Per Intersection

Note: THE CITY RESERVES THE RIGHT TO AWARD THIS BID ON THE BASIS OF EACH LINE INDIVIDUALLY,
ANY COMBINATION OF LINE ITEMS OR ALL LINE ITEMS COMBINED AS IT DETERMINES TO BE IN

ITS BEST INTEREST. THE CITY RESERVES THE RIGHT TO NOT AWARD ANY LINE ITEM AS IT
DETERMINES TO BE IN ITS BEST INTEREST.

Note: THE CITY RESERVES THE RIGHT TO ADD OR DELETE LOCATIONS, SERVICES, ITEMS, OR
MATERIALS FROM THIS CONTRACT SHOULD IT BE IN THE BEST INTEREST OF THE CITY. THE

CONTRACT PRICE MAY BE ADJUSTED UPON AGREEMENT OF THE CONTRACTOR AND THE CITY’S
REPRESENTATIVE AND BASED UPON BID PRICES.

[THE REMAINDER OF THIS PAGE IS INTENTIONALLY BLANK]

This page must be completed and uploaded with your Submittal.
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DRUG-FREE WORKPLACE FORM

The undersigned bidder in accordance with Florida Statute 287.087 hereby certifies that

V. E. Whitehurst & Sons, Inc.
does:

(Name of Bidder)

1. Publish a statement notifying employees that the unlawful manufacture, distribution, dispensing, possession,
or use of a controlled substance is prohibited in the workplace and specifying the actions that will be taken
against employees for violations of such prohibition.

2. Inform employees about the dangers of drug abuse in the workplace, the business’s policy of maintaining a
drug-free workplace, any available drug counseling, rehabilitation, and employee assistance programs, and the
penalties that may be imposed upon employees for the drug abuse violations.

5 Give each employee engaged in providing the commodities or contractual services that are under bid a copy
of the statement specified in subsection (1).

4. In the statement specified in subsection (1), notify the employees that, as a condition of working on the
commodities or contractual services that are under bid, the employee will abide by the terms of the statement
and will notify the employer of any conviction of, or plea of guilty or nolo contendere to, any violation of
Chapter 893 or of any controlled substance law of the United States or any state, for a violation occurring in
the workplace no later than five (5) days after such conviction.

B Impose a sanction on, or require the satisfactory participation in a drug abuse assistance or rehabilitation
program if such is available in the employee’s community, by any employee who is so convicted.

6. Make a good faith effort to continue to maintain a drug-free workplace through implementation of this
section.

As the person authorized to sign the statement, [ certify that this bidder complies fully with the 2 requirements.

Bidder’s Signature Jackson W. Whitehurst - Vice President

January 30, 2023
Date

In the event of a tie bid, bidders with a Drug Free Workplace Program will be given preference. To be considered

for the preference, this document must be completed and uploaded to DemandStar.com with your Submittal.
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BIDDER VERIFICATION FORM

LOCAL PREFERENCE (Check one)
Local Preference requested: @ YES []JNO

A copy of the following documents must be included in your submission if you are requesting Local Preference:
e Business Tax Receipt
¢ Zoning Compliance Permit

QUALIFIED SMALL BUSINESS AND/OR SERVICE DISABLED VETERAN BUSINESS STATUS (Check one)

Is your business qualified, in accordance with the City of Gainesville’s Small Business Procurement Program, as 2 local Small
Business? (JYES [HNO

Is your business qualified, in accordance with the City of Gainesville’s Small Business Procurement Program, as a local Service-
Disabled Veteran Business? [_| YES [H] NO

LIVING WAGE COMPLIANCE
See Living Wage Decision Tree:
(Check one)
Living Wage Ordinance does not apply (check all that apply)
Not a covered service
Contract does not exceed $100,000
[l Not a for-profit individual, business entity, corporation, partnership, limited liability company, joint venture,
or similar business, who or which employees 50 or more persons, but not including employees of any
subsidiaries, affiliates or parent businesses.
[] Located within the City of Gainesville enterprise zone.
O Living Wage Ordinance applies and the completed Certification of Compliance with Living Wage is included with this
bid.

NOTE: If Contractor has stated Living Wage Ordinance does not apply and it is later determined Living Wage
Ordinance does apply, Contractor will be requited to comply with the provision of the City of Gainesville’s living
wage requirements, as applicable, without any adjustment to the bid price.

REGISTERED TO DO BUSINESS IN THE STATE OF FL.ORIDA
Is Bidder registered with Florida Department of State’s, Division of Corporations, to do business in the State of Florida?
M YES [ ] NO (refer to Part 1, 1.5, last paragraph)

If the answer is “YES”, provide a copy of SunBiz registration or SunBiz Document Number (# P02000008282 )

If the answer is “NQO”, please state reason why:

DIVERSITY AND INCLUSION (Applies to solicitations above $50,000)
Does your company have a policy on diversity and inclusion? [JYES [@NO

If yes, please attach a copy of the policy to your submittal.

Note: Possessing a diversity and inclusion policy will have no effect on the City’s consideration of your submitial, but is simply being requested jor information
Lathereng prrposes.

V. E. Whitehurst & Sons, Inc.
Biddet’s Name

Jack W. Whitehyrst, Vice Presmmﬂ_é / .

Printed Name/4Atle of Augho
%/ \ 1/30/23

%gna re of Authorized Representative Date

This page must be completed and uploaded to DemandStar.com with your Submittal
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State of Florida
Department of State

I certify from the records of this office that V. E. WHITEHURST & SONS,
INC. is a corporation organized under the laws of the State of Florida, filed on
January 24, 2002.

The document number of this corporation is P02000008282.

I further certify that said corporation has paid all fees due this office through
December 31, 2023, that its most recent annual report/uniform business report
was filed on January 27, 2023, and that its status is active.

I further certify that said corporation has not filed Articles of Dissolution.

Given under my hand and the
Great Seal of the State of Florida
at Tallahassee, the Capital, this
the Twenty-seventh day of
January, 2023

==y

Secretary of Séute

Tracking Number: 3231964232CC

To authenticate this certificate,visit the following site,enter this number, and then
follow the instructions displayed.

https://services.sunbiz.org/Filings/CertificateOQfStatus/CertificateAuthentication




CUSTOMER HISTORY

Name of Bidder: V. E. Whitehurst & Sons, Inc.

Provide a list of prior customers for similar services that your bidder has provided within the last_five (5) years. Copy form

as necessary.

Customer Name: Florida Department of Transportation - Gainesville

Address:5301-A NE 39th Ave

City, State, Zip: Gainesville, FL 32609

Point of Contact: Joaquin Olivella, PE

Phone Number: 352-381-4214

E-mail: jauquin.olivella@dot.state.fl.us

Customer Name: Alachua County Public Worsk Department

Address: 5620 NW 120th Lane

City, State, Zip: Gainesville, FL 32653

Point of Contact: Ramon D. Gavarrete, PE

Phone Number: 352-548-1214

E-mail: rgavarrete@alachaucounty.us

Customer Name: Levy County

Address: PO Box 778

City, State, Zip: Bronson, FL 32621

Point of Contact: Lee Mills, PE

Phone Number: 352-486-2872

E-mail: millseng@bellsouth.net

Customer Name: FDOT - Lake City

Address: 710 NW Lake Jeffery Road

City, State, Zip: Lake City, FL 32055

Point of Contact: Doug Moseley, PE

Phone Number: 356-961-7030

E-mail: douglas.moseley@dot.state.fl.us

Customer Name: Bradford County Public WOrks

Address: 945 North Temple Avenue

City, State, Zip: Starke, FL 32091

Point of Contact: Jason Dodds

Phone Number: 352-278-3415

E-mail: jason_Dodds@bradfordcountyfl.gov

This page must be completed and uploaded to DemandStar.com with your Submittal.
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RESPONSIBLE AGENT FORM

RESPONSIBLE AGENT: William J. Whitehurst

ADDRESS: 20551 NE 75th Street - Williston, FL 32696

PHONE NO.: 352-528-2101

o, 352-528-3857

EMAIL ADDRESS: aburleson@vewhitehurst.com

ALTERNATE RESPONSIBLE AGENT: S 2cK W. Whitehurst

ADDRESS: 20551 NE 75th Street - Williston, FL 32696

PHONE NO - 352-528-2101

Pax N, 352-528-3857

EMAIL ADDRESS: aburleson@vewhitehurst.com

This page must be completed and uploaded to DemandStar.com with your Submittal.
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[~=]
Form w 9

(Rev. October 2018)

Department of the Treasury
Internal Revenue Service

Request for Taxpayer
Identification Number and Certification

> Go to www.irs.gov/FormW@ for instructions and the latest information.

Give Form to the
requester. Do not
send to the IRS.

V.E. Whitehurst & Sons, Inc.

1 Name (as shown on your income tax return). Name is required cn this line; do not leave this line blank.

2 Business name/disregarded entity name, if different from above

following seven boxes.

D Individual/sole proprietor or D C Corporation

single-member LLC

Print or type.

[] other (see instructions) »

S Corporation

D Limited liability company. Enter the tax classification (C=C corporation, S=S corporation, P=Partnership) »
Note: Check the appropriate box in the line above for the tax classification of the single-member owner. Do not check | Exemption from FATCA reporting
LLC if the LLC is classified as a single-member LLC that is disregarded from the owner unless the owner of the LLC is
another LLC that is not disregarded from the owner for U.S. federal tax purposes. Otherwise, a single-member LLC that
is disregarded from the owner should check the appropriate box for the tax classification of its owner.

3 Check appropriate box for federal tax classification of the person whose name is entered on line 1. Check only one of the | 4 Exemptions (codes apply only to

certain entities, not individuals; see
instructions on page 3):
D Partnership |:| Trust/estate

Exempt payee code (if any)

code (if any)

(Applies to accounts maintained outside the U.S.)

5 Address (number, street, and apt. or suite no.) See instructions.

20551 NE 75th Street

See Specific Instructions on page 3.

Requester’s name and address (optional)

6 City, state, and ZIP code
Williston, FL 32696

7 List account number(s) here (optional)

Taxpayer Identification Number (TIN)

Enter your TIN in the appropriate box. The TIN provided must match the name given on line 1 to avoid
backup withholding. For individuals, this is generally your social security number (SSN). However, for a
resident alien, sole proprietor, or disregarded entity, see the instructions for Part |, later. For other - -
entities, it is your employer identification number (EIN). If you do not have a number, see How to get a

TIN, later.

Note: If the account is in more than one name, see the instructions for line 1. Also see What Name and

Number To Give the Requester for guidelines on whose number to enter.

[ Social security number

or
[ Employer identification number

04| -13|16[1|9|4]|8]|2

Il Certification

Under penalties of perjury, | certify that:

1. The number shown on this form is my correct taxpayer identification number (or | am waiting for a number to be issued to me}; and
2. | am not subject to backup withholding because: (a) | am exempt from backup withholding, or (b) | have not been notified by the Internal Revenue
Service {IRS) that | am subject to backup withholding as a result of a failure to report all interest or dividends, or (c) the IRS has notified me that | am

no longer subject to backup withholding; and
3. | am a U.S. citizen or other U.S. person (defined below); and

4. The FATCA code(s) entered on this form (if any) indicating that | am exempt from FATCA reporting is correct.
Certification instructions. You must cross out item 2 abave if you have been notified by the IRS that you are currently subject to backup withholding because

you have failed to report all interest and dividends on your tax return. For real estate
acquisition or abandonment of secured property, cancellation of debt, contributiol
other than interest and durldend//yuu ai not required to sign the certlf iop/ b

sactions, item 2 does not apply. For mertgage interest paid,

u must provide your correct TIN. See the instructions for Part I, later.

n/éo an individual retirement arrangement (IRA), and generally, payments

Sign Signature of
Here U.S. person & ﬁ

General Instrug,/tlons

Section references are to the Internal Revenue Code unless otherwise
noted.

Future developments. For the latest information about developments
related to Form W-8 and its instructions, such as legislation enacted
after they were published, go to www.irs.gov/FormW$.,

Purpose of Form

An individual or entity (Form W-9 requester) who is required to file an
information return with the IRS must obtain your correct taxpayer
identification number (TIN) which may be your social security number
(SSN), individual taxpayer identification number (ITIN), adoption
taxpayer identification number (ATIN), or employer identification number
(EIN), to report on an information return the amount paid to you, or other
amount reportable on an information return. Examples of information
returns include, but are not limited to, the following.

= Form 1099-INT (interest earned or paid)

W ..., January 30, 2023

» Form 1099-DIV (dividends, including those from stocks or mutual
funds)

s Form 1099-MISC (various types of income, prizes, awards, or gross
proceeds)

» Form 1099-B (stock or mutual fund sales and certain other
transactions by brokers)

= Form 1099-S (proceeds from real estate transactions)

= Form 1099-K (merchant card and third party network transactions)
= Form 1098 (home mortgage interest), 1098-E (student loan interest),
1098-T (tuition)

s Form 1099-C (canceled debt)

* Form 1099-A (acquisition or abandonment of secured property)

Use Form W-9 only if you are a U.S. person (including a resident
alien), to provide your correct TIN.

If you do not return Form W-9 to the requester with a TIN, you might
be subject to backup withholding. See What is backup withholding,
later.

Cat. No. 10231X

Form W=-9 (Rev. 10-2018)
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CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

VEWHITE-01 SEGVSSHILTS
DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)

1/27/2023

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED

REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT:

If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on
this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

PRODUCER

AssuredPartners, Gainesville
4880 Newberry Road, Suite 180
Gainesville, FL 32607

GONTACT Shirley Hill Shilts

Ao, Ext): (352) 378-2511 | A% Noy:(352) 378-9801

SR .. Shirley.Shilts@assuredpartners.com

INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
INsURER A : Cincinnati Insurance Company 10677
INSURED iNnsurer B : BITCO General Corp 20095
VE Whitehurst & Sons, Inc. INSURER C :
20551 NE 75 Street INSURER D :
Williston, FL 32696
INSURERE :
INSURERF :
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

INSR TYPE OF INSURANCE ADOLISUBR POLICY NUMBER Y R | (MO LIMITS
A | X | COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY EACH OCCURRENGE $ 1,000,000
CLAIMS-MADE OCCUR ENP0553215 10/1/2022 | 10/1/2023 | BAVAGETORENTED | ¢ 100,000
[ MED EXP (Any one person) $ 1 0’000
L PERSONAL & ADV INJURY | § 1,000,000
| GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE $ 2,000,000
PoLICY FES Loc PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGG | $ 2,000,000
OTHER. EMPLOYEE BENEFI |, 3,000,000
A | AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY GOMBINED SINGLE LIMIT s 1,000,000
X | ANY AUTO ENP0553215 10/1/2022 | 10/1/2023 | BODILY INJURY (Per person) | §
OWNED SCHEDULED
AUTOS ONLY AUTOS BODILY INJURY (Per accident) | $
HIRED NON-OWNED PROPERTY DAMAGE
|| AUTOS ONLY AUTOS ONLY (Per accident) $
$
A | X | UMBRELLA LIAB X | occur EACH OCCURRENCE $ 5,000,000
EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE ENP0553215 10/1/2022 | 10/1/2023 AGGREGATE $ 5,000,000
DED ‘ ‘ RETENTION $ $
WORKERS COMPENSATION PER oT
B AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY YIN X | STATuTE ‘ ‘ ER
ANY PROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE WC3725108 1172023 | 11112024 | | C\cpi accipEnT $ 1,000,000
OFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUD N/A 1,000,000
(Mandatory in NH) E.L. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE| $ ,000,
If yes, describe under 1,000,000
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT | § »9UY,

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space is required)

BID #PWDA-230027-DH

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

CANCELLATION

City of Gainesville, Florida, a Municipal Corporation
Procurement

200 E. University Avenue, Room #339

Gainesville, FL 32601

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

Gk

ACORD 25 (2016/03)

© 1988-2015 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.

The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD



Customer Copyv

CITY OF GAINESVILLE

BUSINESS TAX RECEIPT TAX YEAR BEGINS OCTOBER 1, 2022

AND ENDS SEPTEMBER 30, 2023
BILLING AND COLLECTIONS OFFICE
TREASURY DIVISION OF THE FINANCE DEPARTMENT ~ BUSINESS TAX NO.

Please display in your

place of business citybc@gainesvillefl.gov 2111 3
RO
V. E. WHITEHURST & SONS, INC.
BUSINESS LOCATION
20551 NE 75TH ST 2330 NW 73RD PL
WILLISTON, FL 32696 BUSINESS PHONE
352-373-3816
BUSINESS E-MAIL

vewoffice@atlantic.net

Thank you for paying your bus:ness taxes for the period October 7 2022 September 30, 2023.

“CATEGORY = = , TON G o s s A EEE o
1001 FICT!TIOUS NAME REQUIREMENT $0.00
6245 MANUFACTURING NOT LISTED SEPARATELY $52.50
6801 COMMERCIALLY ZONED $0.00

TOTAL ASSIGNED: $52.50

TOTAL PAID: $52.50
AN DUE: | $0.00

APPROVED BY FINANCE DIRECTOR

00000

BCTSEFEOE1494BF980019DB388EBO3BA

ALL CITY, STATE AND FEDERAL REQUIREMENTS MUST BE MET IN ORDER TO LEGALLY OPERATE A BUSINESS,
PROFESSION OR OCCUPATION WITHIN THE CORPORATE LIMITS OF GAINESVILLE, FLORIDA. PAYMENT OF BUSINESS
TAXES AND A RECEIPT FOR PAYMENT DOES NOT IMPLY THAT A BUSINESS HAS COMPLIED WITH ANY OR ALL OTHER

RELEVANT STATUTORY AND REGULATORY PROVISIONS

THE CITY OF GAINESVILLE DOES NOT REFUND BUSINESS TAXES PAID IN ERROR UNLESS THE ERROR IS A CLERICAL
MISTAKE MADE BY THE CITY.

If you have any questions about the Business Tax requirements or process, please email citybc@gainesvillfl.gov
If you cannot email to the address above, please call (352) 334-5024

IT IS THE BUSINESS OWNER'S RESPONSIBILITY TO REPORT ANY CHANGES IN BUSINESS INFORMATION
DURING THE YEAR TO citybc@aainesvillefl.gov OR TOWEB SITE  http://eservices.cityofgainesville.org




FDOT

Florida Department of Transportation
RON DESANTIS 605 Suwannee Street JARED W. PERDUE, P.E.
GOVERNOR Tallahassee, FL 32399-0450 SECRETARY

April 19, 2022

WHITEHURST, V. E. & SONS, INC.
20551 NE 75TH STREET
WILLISTON, FLORIDA 32696

RE: CERTIFICATE OF QUALIFICATION

The Department of Transportation has qualified your company for the type of work
indicated below.

FDOT APPROVED WORK CLASSES:
DRAINAGE, FLEXIBLE PAVING, GRADING, GRASSING, SEEDING AND SODDING, HOT PLANT-MIXED
BITUM. COURSES, SIDEWALK

Unless notified otherwise, this Certificate of Qualification will expire 6/30/2023.

In accordance with Section 337.14(4), Florida Statutes, changes to Ability Factor or
Maximum Capacity Rating will not take effect until after the expiration of the current
certificate of prequalification (if applicable).

In accordance with Section 337.14(1), Florida Statutes, an application for
qualification must be filed within (4) months of the ending date of the applicant’s
audited annual financial statements.

If the company's maximum capacity has been revised, it may be accessed by logging into
the Contractor Prequalification Application System via the following link:
HTTPS://fdotwpl.dot.state.fl.us/ContractorPreQualification

Once logged in, select "View" for the most recently approved application, and then
click the "Manage" and "Application Summary" tabs.

The company may apply for a Revised Certificate of Qualification at any time prior to
the expiration date of this certificate according to Section 14-22.0041(3), Florida
Administrative Code (F.A.C.), by accessing the most recently approved application as
shown above and choosing "Update" instead of "View." If certification in additional
classes of work is desired, documentation is needed to show that the company has
performed such work.

All prequalified contractors are required by Section 14-22.006(3), F.A.C., to certify
their work underway monthly in order to adjust maximum bidding capacity to available
bidding capacity. You can find the link to this report at the website shown above.

Sincerely,

Alan Autry, Manager

Contracts Administration Office
AA:cg

Improve Safety, Enhance Mobility, Inspire Innovation
www.fdot.gov



PROPOSED SUBCONTRACTORS FORM

Name of Bidder: V- E- Whitehurst & Sons, Inc.

This form is for all Subcontractors being utilized on this project.

N/A

Name of Contractot:

Address:

Scope of Work to be Performed:

Total § Value: § % of Total BID/RFP: %

N/A

Name of Contractor:

Address:

Scope of Work to be Performed:

Total § Value: § % of Total BID/RFP: %

N/A

Name of Contractor:

Address:

Scope of Work to be Performed:

Total $ Value: § % of Total BID/RFP: %

N/A

Name of Contractot:

Address:

Scope of Work to be Performed:

Total § Value: § % of Total BID/RFP: %

N/A

Name of Contractot:

Address:

Scope of Work to be Performed:
Total § Value: § % of Total BID/RFP: %

If additional space is requited for your subcontractor listing, make copies of this form and submit with you bid package.

This page must be completed and uploaded to DemandStar.com with your Submittal.
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PROJECT MANAGER AND SUPERINTENDENT OR OWNER’S EXPERIENCE

NAME AND TITLE ROLE IN THIS PROJECT YEARS EXPERIENCE
TOTAL WITH THIS FIRM
William J. Whitehurst President 49 49
RELEVANT PROJECTS
1. PROJECT TITLE AND LOCATION (city and state) YEAR COMPLETED
See Attached Form

BRIEF DESCRIPTION (Brief scope, size, costs, etc.) and SPECIFIC ROLE OCheck if project completed with cutrent firm

. PROJECT TITLE AND LOCATION (city and state) YEAR COMPLETED

BRIEF DESCRIPTION (Brief scope, size, costs, etc.) and SPECIFIC ROLE LCheck if project completed with cutrent firm

3. PROJECT TITLE AND LOCATION (city and state) YEAR COMPLETED

BRIEF DESCRIPTION (Brief scope, size, costs, ctc.) and SPECIFIC ROLE LCheck if project completed with cutrent firm

4. PROJECT TITLE AND LOCATION (city and state) YEAR COMPLETED

BRIEF DESCRIPTION (Brief scope, size, costs, ctc.) and SPECIFIC ROLE LCheck if project completed with cutrent firm

5. PROJECT TITLE AND LOCATION (city and state) YEAR COMPLETED

BRIEF DESCRIPTION (Brief scope, size, costs, etc.) and SPECIFIC ROLE OCheck if project completed with cutrent firm

6. PROJECT TITLE AND LOCATION (city and state) YEAR COMPLETED

BRIEF DESCRIPTION (Brief scope, size, costs, etc.) and SPECIFIC ROLE OCheck if project completed with cutrent firm

This page must be completed and uploaded to DemandS Page must be completed once or twice and uploaded to

DemandStar.com with your Submittal if required by 1.5
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V.E. WHITEHURST & SONS, INC.

20551 NORTH EAST 75™ STREET
WILLISTON, FLORIDA 32696
PHONE (352) 528-2101 FAX 528-3857

WILLIAM J. WHITEHURST DEVIN C. WHITEHURST
PRESIDENT TREASURER
JACKW. WHITEHURST J. CHRIS BURLESON
VICE PRESIDENT SECRETARY

Project References and Recent
Contracts V.E. Whitehurst & Sons, Inc. has performed:

Alachua County — SW 8" Ave Connector — Project # 6320, 6341 & 6394, Improvements include milling
and resurfacing, base work, curb and gutters, traffic signals, highway signing, sidewalks and other
incidental construction. $13,828,624.85. Contact Tom Strom, P.E. (352) 548-1223. Date Completed:
January 25, 2022.

Alachua County — CR 219A from US 301 to SR 26, Improvements include milling and resurfacing, base
work, drainage, highway signing, and other incidental construction. $3,592,149.57. Contact Tom Strom,
P.E. (352) 548-1223. Date Completed: January 13, 2022.

FDOT 439344-1-52-01, Contract No. T2765, SR 24 from SR 45 to East of SW 81% ST. 6.868 Miles,
Alachua County. Improvements include milling and resurfacing, base work, highway signing, and other
incidental construction. $3,724,071.66. Contact: Rusty Cheshire, Project Administrator, 352-381-4213,
Date Completed: March 4, 2021

Levy County — Cedar Key George T. Lewis Airport - Improvements include milling, reclaiming, paving,
lighting, striping, and other incidental work. $837,306.45. Contact: David Harris, Project Administrator,
904-224-7083. Date Completed: December 10, 2020.

Keystone Airpark — Rehabilitate Taxiway A & B. Improvements include milling, subgrade, base, asphalt
paving, drainage, fueling station, striping, lighting and other incidentals. $3,596,442.45. Contact: William
Prange, P.E., (386) 898-2298. Date Completed: June 15, 2020.

Alachua County — NW 43" ST Resurfacing — Project # 6365, Improvements include milling and
resurfacing, base work, curb and gutters, sidewalk, traffic signals, highway signing, sidewalks and other
incidental construction. $4,964,913.21. Contact Tom Strom, P.E. (352) 548-1223. Date Completed: July
13, 2020.

Alachua County — NW 16" Ave — Project # 917-7902, Improvements include milling and resurfacing,
signalization, highway signing, curb and gutters, sidewalk and other incidental construction.
$1,185,609.80. Contact James Link, P.E. (352) 548-1289. Date Completed: June 25, 2020.

FDOT 437339-1-52-01, Contract No. E5Z45, SR 500 (US 27) from Levy Co. Line to CR 326. 6.672
Miles, Marion County. Improvements include milling and resurfacing, base work, highway signing, and
other incidental construction. $6,177,973.72. Contact: Kevin Wagner, Project Administrator, 352-281-
6857, Date Completed: January 30, 2020



Alachua County — Resource Recovery Park — Project # 6398, Improvements include milling and
resurfacing, base work, highway signing, and other incidental construction. $2,564,298.39. Contact James
Link, P.E. (352) 548-1289. Date Completed: November 19, 2019.

Alachua County — SW 8" Ave Extension Phase 2 — Project # 6396, Improvements include milling and
resurfacing, base work, curb and gutters, traffic signals, highway signing, sidewalks and other incidental
construction. $4,281,348.75. Contact Tom Strom, P.E. (352) 548-1223. Date Completed: July 16, 2019.

FDOT 436164-1-52-01, Contract No. T2680, US 441 from Alachua Co. Line to I-75. 9.651 Miles,
Columbia County. Improvements include milling and resurfacing, base work, highway signing, and other
incidental construction. $4,259,756.04 Contact: Joe Lovelace, Project Administrator, 386-961-7214, Date
Completed: January 14, 2019

FDOT 434323-1-52-01, Contract No. E2V65, SR 24(Archer Rd.) from SW 40" Blvd to SR 226. 4.212
Miles, Alachua County. Improvements include milling and resurfacing, base work, curb and gutters,
traffic signals, highway signing, sidewalks and other incidental construction. $3,723,121.82. Contact:
Kevin Wagner, Project Administrator, 352-281-6857, Date Completed: June 7, 2018

FDOT 432314-1-52-01, Contract No. E2V68, SR 100 from CR 100A to West Orange Street. 2.545 Miles,
Bradford County. Improvements include milling and resurfacing, curb and gutters, highway signing,
guardrail, sidewalks and other incidental construction. $949,301.94 Contact: Mabelle Westling, Project
Administrator, 352-381-4211, Date Completed: February 09, 2018

FDOT 432311-1-52-01, Contract No. T2649, SR 200 (US 301) from Railroad Overpass to Bradford
County Line. 3.431 Miles, Alachua County. Improvements include milling and resurfacing, base work,
shoulder treatment, drainage improvements, curb and gutters, traffic signals, highway signing, guardrail,
sidewalks and other incidental construction. $3,476,169.44. Contact Cory Nichols, P.E.,

Date Completed: October 4, 2017

FDOT 434295-1-52-01, Contract No. T2644. SR 100 from East of SR 121 to Bradford County Line,
3.423 Miles, Union County, Improvements include milling and resurfacing, base work, shoulder
treatment, drainage improvements, highway signing, bridges and other incidental construction.
$1,424,722.42. Contact: Mark Smith, Project Administrator, 386-961-7031. Date Completed: April 12,
2017.

Levy County — CR 326 (Shell Mound Rd) from CR 347 to dead end. Improvements include resurfacing,
widening, drainage, striping and other incidental work. $1,391,234.50. Contact: H. Lee Mills, P.E., 352-
486-2872. Date Completed: March 31, 2017.

Suwannee County — 180™ ST from CR 249 to SR 49. Improvements include resurfacing, widening,
drainage, striping and other incidental work. $1,181,243.30. Contact: Brenda Flanagan, Project Manager,
386-361-2132. Date Completed: March 13, 2017.



ADDENDUM NO. 1

Date: January 27, 2023 Bid Date: January 30, 2023
at 3:00 P.M. (Local Time)

Bid Name Pavement Management (Preservation & Surfacing) Bid No.: PWDA-230027-DH
Continuing Services

NOTE:  This Addendum has been issued only to the holders of record of the specifications.

The original Specifications remain in full force and effect except as revised by the following changes
which shall take precedence over anything to the contrary:

I. Any questions shall be submitted in writing to the City of Gainesville Purchasing Division by 3:00 p.m.
(local time), January 23, 2023. Questions may be submitted as follows:
Email: holderds@gainesville.org

2. Please find attached:

a) Copy of the cone of silence information (Financial Procedures Manual Section 41-524
Prohibition of Lobbying in Procurement Matters)).

The following are answers/clarifications to questions received:

3. Question: On the reference ITB, page 77 of 82, at the Living Wage Compliance section, a Certification
of Compliance with Living Wage is mentioned. Can you please advise me on how a
corporation becomes certified if they are already compliant? Is there a Certification form
that is available?

Answer: A Certification form is not required.

4. Question: After reviewing the specks laid out in the bid outline, our product, CPR, exceeds the specified
requirements. Attached you will find the information regarding the testing and specifications of
CPR Asphalt Rejuvenator. We are extremely interested in the opportunity to provide a bid upon
approval from the proper department.
Answer: The City of Gainesville will accept any asphalt rejuvenation product that meets the full
requirements of Section 335-4 of the Technical Specifications posted with this solicitation.
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Bid Number: PWDA-230027-DH
Bid Name: Pavement Management (Preservation & Surfacing) Continuing Services

ACKNOWLEDGMENT: Each Proposer shall acknowledge receipt of this Addendum No. 1 by his or her
signature below, and a copy of this Addendum to be returned with proposal.

CERTIFICATION BY PROPOSER
The undersigned acknowledges receipt of this Addendum No. 1 and the Proposal submitted is in accordance
with information, instructions, and stipulations set forth herein.

PROPOSER: V. E. Whitehurst & So/r)s, Inc. s/
BY: W,W
DATE: January 30, 2023
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Bid Number: PWDA-230027-DH
Bid Name: Pavement Management (Preservation & Surfacing) Continuing Services

CITY OF FINANCIAL SERVICES
GAINESVILLE PROCEDURES MANUAL

41-524 Prohibition of Lobbying in Procurement Matters

Except as expressly set forth in Resolution 170116, Section 9, during the Cone of Silence as defined herein no
person may lobby, on behalf of a competing party in a particular procurement process, City Officials or
employees, except the Procurement Division or the procurement designated staff contact person. Violation of
this provision shall result in disqualification of the party on whose behalf the lobbying occurred.

Cone of Silence period means the period between the issue date which allows for immediate submittals to the
City of Gainesville Procurement Division in response to an invitation to bid, or a request for proposal, or
qualifications, or information, or an invitation to negotiate, as applicable, and the time that City Officials or the
Procurement Division, or City Department awards the contract.

Lobbying means when a person seeks to influence or attempt to influence City Officials or employees with
respect to a decision of the City, except as authorized by procurement procedures.
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