2023-240B

BID COVER PAGE

City of Procurement Division

s < 352) 334-5021 (main
GalneSVllle I(ssucz Date: 12/(1‘19172.’3

INVITATION TO BID: # PWDA-230028-DH
Stormwater Management Continuing Services

PRE-BID MEETING: O Non-Mandatory 0O Mandatory N/A O Includes Site Visit
DATE: TIME:
LOCATION:

BRSNS )anuary 24,2023 @ 3:00 pm

All meetings and submittal deadlines are Eastera Time (ET).

DUE DATE FOR UPLOADING BID RESPONSE: January 31, 2023 @ 3:00PM

SUMMARY OF SCOPE OF WORK:

Push button construction services relating to stormwater management facilities including new construction,
reconstruction, rehabilitation, repair and maintenance. Activities include but are not limited to removing sediment and
trash from basins and traps, erosion repair & stabilization, grading of drainage swales, cleaning/repait/replacement of
stormwater structures, construction/modification of detention/retention ponds and stabilization.

Bidder is not in atrears to City upon any debt, fee, tax or contract: EI Bidder is NOT in arrears [ ] Bidder IS in arrears
Bidder is not a defaulter, as surety or otherwise, upon any obligation to City: [5 Bidder is NOT in default [] Bidder IS in default

Bidders who receive this bid from sources other than City of Gainesville Procurement Division or DemandStar MUST contact the
Procurement Division prior to the due date to ensure any addenda are received in order to submit a responsible and responsive offer.
Uploading an incomplete document may deem the offer non-responsive, causing rejection.

ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGMENT: Prior to submitting my offer, I have verified that all addenda issued to date are considered as
part of my offer: Addenda received (list all) #

Legal Name of Bidder: Watson Construction Company LL.C

DBA:

D Dab -Ow
Authorized Representative Name/Title: ouglas Dabney ner

E-mail Address: doug.dabney@watsonconstruct.com — 80-0219140

Street Address: 940 NW 247th Drive Newberry, FL 32669

Mailing Address (if different):

Telephone: (352 _y 4729157 P (352 ) 472-2520

By signing this form, I acknowledge I have read and understand, and my business complies with all General Conditions and requirements
set forth herein; and,

&l Bid is in full compliance with the Specifications.
;
O Bid is in full compliance with specifications except as specifically stated and attached )\xe/véty/

SIGNATURE OF AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE: / e ol

Douglas Dabney /(1 /31/2023
SIGNER’S PRINTED NAME: DATE!

This page must be completed and uploaded to DemandStar.com with yout Submittal.
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BIDDER VERIFICATION FORM

LOCAL PREFERENCE (Check one)
Local Preference requested: C1YES [INO

A copy of the following documents must be included in your submission if you are requesting Local Preference:
e Business Tax Receipt
o Zoning Compliance Permit

QUALIFIED SMALL BUSINESS AND/OR SERVICE DISABLED VETERAN BUSINESS STATUS (Check one)

Is your business qualified, in accordance with the City of Gainesville’s Small Business Procurement Program, as a local Small
Business? [Dyes [EINO

Is your business qualified, in accordance with the City of Gainesville’s Small Business Procurement Program, as a local Service-
Disabled Veteran Business? [ |YES [ ]NO

LIVING WAGE COMPLIANCE
See Living Wage Decision Tree:

(Check one)

] Living Wage Ordinance does not apply (check all that apply)

Not a covered sexvice
% Contract does not exceed $100,000

Not a for-profit individual, business entity, corporation, partnership, limited liability company, joint venture,
or similar business, who or which employees 50 or more persons, but not including employees of any
subsidiaries, affiliates or parent businesses.
Located within the City of Gainesville enterprise zone.

1 Living Wage Ordinance applies and the completed Certification of Compliance with Living Wage is included with this

bid.

NOTE: If Contractor has stated Living Wage Ordinance does not apply and it is later determined Living Wage
Otrdinance does apply, Contractor will be required to comply with the provision of the City of Gainesville’s living
wage tequirements, as applicable, without any adjustment to the bid price.

REGISTERED TO DO BUSINESS IN THE STATE OF FLORIDA

Is Bidder registered with Florida Department of State’s, Division of Cotporations, to do business in the State of Florida?
[x] YES ] NO (refer to Part 1, 1.5, last paragraph)

If the answer is “YES”, provide a copy of SunBiz registration or SunBiz Document Number (# 108000014232 )
If the answer is “NO”, please state reason why:

DIVERSITY AND INCLUSION (Applies to solicitations above $50,000)
Does your company have a policy on diversity and inclusion? [JyEs kINO

If yes, please attach a copy of the policy to your submittal.

Note: Poisessing a diversity and inclusion policy will have no gffect on the City’s consideration of your submittal, but is simply being requested for information
Sathering purposes.
Watson Construction Company LLC

Bidder’s Name
Douglas Dabney-Owner A

Print¢d Name/Title of Au{r;ht'_?;ééd Representative
Ht U l 7 L.

SepAure of Anftfized K‘;pre;=ﬁ4ﬁve Date

VW jg

01/31/2023

This page must be completed and uploaded to DemandStar.com with your Submittal,
Ti-Bidding Document - TTB - Services - Page 74 of 79



DRUG-FREE WORKPLACE FORM

The undersigned bidder in accordance with Florida Statute 287.087 hereby certifies that

Watson Construction Company LLC
does:

(IName of Bidder)

1. Publish a statement notifying employees that the unlawful manufacture, distribution, dispensing, possession,
or use of a controlled substance is prohibited in the workplace and specifying the actions that will be taken
against employees for violations of such prohibition.

2. Inform employees about the dangers of drug abuse in the wotkplace, the business’s policy of maintaining a
drug-free workplace, any available drug counseling, rehabilitation, and employee assistance programs, and the
penalties that may be imposed upon employees for the drug abuse violations.

3. Give each employee engaged in providing the commodities or contractual services that are under bid a copy
of the statement specified in subsection (1).

4. In the statement specified in subsection (1), notify the employees that, as a condition of working on the
commodities or contractual services that are under bid, the employee will abide by the terms of the statement
and will notfy the employer of any conviction of, or plea of guilty or nolo contendere to, any violation of
Chapter 893 or of any controlled substance law of the United States or any state, for a violation occutting in
the workplace no later than five (5) days after such conviction.

5. Impose a sanction on, or require the satisfactory participation in a drug abuse assistance or rehabilitation
progtam if such is available in the employee’s community, by any employee who is so convicted.

6. Make a good faith effort to continue to maintain a drug-free workplace through implementation of this
section.

As the person authorized to sign the statement, I certify that this bidder complies fully with the above requirements.

‘__v",;': / { o
;‘.ﬂ - V. .Jf.a"_.-) f’y
Biflder’s fignature /
01/31/2023
Date

In the event of a tie bid, bidders with a2 Drug Free Wotkplace Program will be given preference. To be considered

for the preference, this document must be completed and uploaded to DemandStar.com with your Submittal.
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PART 4 - BID FORM

Stormwater Management Continuing Services

01/31/2023
Date: /31/

The bidder hereby declares that he has examined the site of the work and informed himself fully in regard to all conditions
pertaining to the place where the work is to be done, and that he has examined the plans, specifications, agreement and all
documents related to the above referenced solicitation for the work and comments hereto attached. The Bidder further declares
that the only persons, company or parties interested in this Bid or the Agreement to be entered into, as principals, are named
herein; that this Bid is made without connection with any other person, company ot parties making a Bid; and it is in all respects

fair and in good faith and without collusion or fraud.

The Bidder proposes and agrees, if this Bid is accepted, to contract with City of Gainesville, Florida, through the City
Commission, , in the form of Agreement specified, to furnish all necessary materials, equipment, machinety, tools, apparatus,
means of transportation, labor and service necessaty to complete the work covered by the Bid Solicitation for: Pavement
Management (Preservation & Surfacing) Continuing Services and to furnish the prescribed Performance and Payment Bond for

as required by the final agreement; and to furnish the required evidence of the specified insurance.
Attached is a list of similar projects and a list of Subcontractors as covered in the Instructions to Bidders.

The Bidder agrees to accept in full compensation for each item the prices named in the schedule incorporated herein and attached
as “Bid Schedule”. The Bidder understands that the quantities shown on the “Bid Schedule” are approximate only and subject
to increase or decrease. Should they be increased or decreased, work will be performed at the unit price bid herein. Actual

quantities will be determined upon completion of the wotk.

This page must be completed and uploaded with your Submittal.
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Stormwater Management Continuing Services

4.1 BID FORM/PAY ITEM LIST
Quantities requested will be placed in a single Work Order for work zones throughout the City. Once mobilized, the City will not require
demobilization or remobilization until Work Order is completed.

MAINTENANCE OF TRAFFIC MOBILIZATION ~ LUMP SUM
BID PRICE
Index 102- Index 102- Index 102- Index 102-
DESCRIPTION | (601, 660122,)611 ot (603 ot 605) (613, 614 or 616) (604 or 615)
Mobilization $ 500.00 $ 500.00 $ 500.00 $ 500.00
MAINTENANCE OF TRAFFIC - HOURLY
DESCRIPTION BID PRICE
Index Cost Per Hour Minimum Daily Cost
Index 102-601 or Index 102-611 $ 250.00 $ 2000.00
Index 102-602 or Index 102-612 | §  250.00 $ 2000.00
Index 102-603 $ 32500 $ 2500.00
Index 102-604 $  400.00 $ 3000.00
Index 102-605 $ NOBID $ NOBID
Index 102-613 $  425.00 $  3500.00
Index 102-614 $ NOBID $ NOBID
Index 102-615 g 490.00 $  4000.00
Index 102-616 $ NO BID $ NOBID
Off-Duty Law Enforcement $ 03.00 $ 500.00

This page must be completed and uploaded with your Submittal.

Ti-Bidding Document - TTB - Services - Page 10 of 79



PREVENTION, CONTROL, AND ABATEMENT OF EROSION AND WATER

POLLUTION
BID PRICE
DESCRIPTION (PER LF PLAN QUANTITY)
Quantity Sediment Barrier
0-100 $ 1500.00 100.00 /LF
101-200 $  2000.00 14.00/LF
201-400 $ 3500.00 12.00/LF
401-700 $ 5600.00 9.00 /LF
701-1,000 $ 7500.00 8.00/LF
>1,000 $ 8000.00 8.00/LF
PREVENTION, CONTROL, AND ABATEMENT OF EROSION AND WATER
POLLUTION
BID PRICE
DESCRIPTION (PER LF PLAN QUANTITY)
: Staked Floating Floating Turbidity
Quantsy; Turbidity Boom Boom
0-50 $ 175.00 $ 125.00
51-100 $ 150.00 $ 100.00
101-200 $ 9500 $ 45.00
>200 $ 90.00 $ 40.00

PREVENTION, CONTROL, AND ABATEMENT OF EROSION AND WATER

POLLUTION
BID PRICE
DESCRIPTION (PER EACH PLAN QUANTITY)
Quantity Inlet Protection System
0-10 § 500.00
11-20 $ 295.00
>20 $ 295.00

This page must be completed and nploaded with your Submittal.
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EARTHWORK AND RELATED ITEMS - EXCAVATION AND EMBANKMENT

BID PRICE
DESCRIPTION (PER CY PLAN QUANTITY)
Quaiy | Rew | Sl | LaeniDieh | G | g
Excavation
0-250 $ NOBID $ NOBID $NO BID $ NO BID $ NOBID
251-500 $ 45.00 $ 55.00 $ NO BID $ NOBID $ NOBID
501-750 $ 45.00 $ 5500 $ NOBID $ NOBID $ NO BID
751-1,000 $ 45.00 $ 55.00 $ NOBID $ NOBID $ NO BID
1,001-2,000 $ 45.00 $ 5500 $ NO BID $ NOBID $ NO BID
2,001-4,000 $ 45.00 $ 55.00 $ NOBID $ NOBID $ NO BID
4,001-6,000 $ 45.00 $ 55.00 $ NOBID $ NOBID $ NO BID
>6,000 $ 45.00 $ 55.00 $ NO BID $ NO BID $ NOBID

EARTHWORK AND RELATED ITEMS -~ SEDIMENT REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL

DESCERESTON (PER CY TRIISIEI;(II,\{RIE(AISEUREMENT)
Quantity i i C&D Disposal Class I Landfill
0-250 $ NOBID $ NOBID $ NOBID
251-500 § 4500 $  57.00 $ NOBID
501-750 $  45.00 $  57.00 $ NO BID
751-1,000 $ 45.00 $ 5700 $ NOBID
1,001-2,000 $ 4500 $ 5700 $ NOBID
2,001-5,000 $ 4500 $ 57.00 ¥ NOBID
5,001-7,000 $ 4500 $ 5700 § NOBD
>7,000 ¥ 4500 ¥ 5700 ¥ NOBD

This page must be completed and uploaded with your Submittal.
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EARTHWORK AND RELATED ITEMS - BORROW

DL CTEINTOIY (PER CY TRI]_;JEE;IRIE:(;EUREMENT)
Quantity Borrow
0-250 $ 390.00
251-500 $ 30.00
501-750 $ 30.00
751-1,000 $ 3000
1,001-2,000 $ 30.00
2,001-4,000 $ 3000
4,001-6,000 $ 3000
>6,000 $ 30.00

PIPE CULVERTS ~ DESILTING OF PIPES

DESCRIPTION BID PRICE
Pipe Size PERLF

<15” (Bquivalent Diameter) $ 350.00

15” (Equivalent Diameter) $ 350.00

24” (Equivalent Diameter) $ 400.00

30” (Equivalent Diameter) $ 450.00

36” (Equivalent Diameter) $ 500.00

42” (Equivalent Diameter) $ 550.00

48” (Equivalent Diameter) $ 600.00

54” (Equivalent Diameter) $ NO BID

60” (Equivalent Diameter) $ NOBD

66” (Equivalent Diametet) $ NOBID

72” (Equivalent Diameter) $ NoOBID
>84” (Equivalent Diameter) $ NO BID

This page must be completed aad uploaded with your Submittal
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PIPE CULVERTS ~ DESILTING OF BOX CULVERTS
R1E LSO (PER CY]i)III.)AII:IR(Iz%aNTITY)
. >5 - 6 >6 - 7° >7° - 8 >8 -9 >0 _10° >10°
] Height HB?xh HB?xh HB'O ’; Hf? Il(n Hf’o !;n Hf'o };n
eight eight eight g g 12
0-50 $ $
51-100 $ $ $
101-150 ' $ $ $
151-200 $ $ $ $ $ $ $
201-300 $ $ $ $ $ $ $
>300 $ $ $ $ $ $ $
INCIDENTAL CONSTRUCTION - REVETMENT SYSTEMS
DESCRIPTION ?;SRP,%%
Quantity (Bank ﬁatgﬁiuggfecﬁon) %ﬁ::ﬁ’fi;‘il:;;
0-25 $ $
26-50 $ T
51-75 u
76-100 $ $
101-150 $ $
151-200 $ ) ]
201-300 $
301-400 $ 1
401-500 $ $
>500 $ $

This page must be completed and uploaded with your Submittal
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INCIDENTAL CONSTRUCTION - PERFORMANCE TURF (STABILIZATION)
BID PRICE
DESCRIPTION (PER SY)
Quantity Petfosmance Tark||[- o oraance TS Seed & Mulch Hydroseed
Pinned
0-250 $ $ $ $
251-500 $ T $
501-750 $ $
751-1,000 $ $ $ $
1,001-2,000 $ $ $ $
2,001-4,000 $ $ k] $
4,001-6,000 $ $ $
>6,000 $ _L $ n $
List of Unit Abbreviations:
SY Square Yards GL Gallons SD Side Drain
LS Lump Sum MG Thousand Gallons ED Each Day
CY Cubic Yards GM Gross Miles CD Cross Drain
EA Each LF Linear Feet AC Acre
TN Tons NM Net Miles RCP Reinforced Concrete Pipe
HR Hour AS  Assembly PI  Per Intersection
Note: THE CITY RESERVES THE RIGHT TO AWARD THIS BID ON THE BASIS OF EACH LINE INDIVIDUALLY,

ANY COMBINATION OF LINE ITEMS OR ALL LINE ITEMS COMBINED AS IT DETERMINES TO BE IN
ITS BEST INTEREST. THE CITY RESERVES THE RIGHT TO NOT AWARD ANY LINE ITEM AS IT
DETERMINES TO BE IN ITS BEST INTEREST.

Note:

THE CITY RESERVES THE RIGHT TO ADD OR DELETE LOCATIONS, SERVICES, ITEMS, OR

MATERIALS FROM THIS CONTRACT SHOULD IT BE IN THE BEST INTEREST OF THE CITY. THE
CONTRACT PRICE MAY BE ADJUSTED UPON AGREEMENT OF THE CONTRACTOR AND THE CITY’S

REPRESENTATIVE AND BASED UPON BID PRICES.

[THE REMAINDER OF THIS PAGE IS INTENTIONALLY BLANK]

This page must be completed and uploaded with your Submittal.
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PROPOSED SUBCONTRACTORS FORM

Watson Construction Company LL.C
Name of Bidder: e = . B

This form is for all Subcontractors being utilized on this project.

Constructi
Name of Contractor: Cf°w“ S ) . S

Address: _1 %316 NW lZ’_Oth Tertace A.lacflua, FL 32618
Co! te Ditch Paving and Conctete Dei
Scope of Wotk to be Performed: nc_m ! - avmg— e .

D
Total § Value: § bl B N ___ % of Total BID/RFP:

SNG Pavement Matking Inc

Name of Contractor; — e _
1104 NW 50th Ave STE A Gainesville FL 32609
Address: - L e

Scope of Work to be Performed: T #vement Markings

TBD = o
Total $ Value: § % of Total BID/RFP:

Name of Contractor:

Address: =
Scope of Work to be Performed: S .
Total § Value: § ) % of Total BID/RFP:

Name of Contractor: _ =

Address: —

Scope of Work to be Petformed: e
Total $ Value: § R B % of Total BID/RFP:
Name of Contractor: — o o

Address: o - = = . -

Scope of Work to be Performed: )
Total § Value: § . % of Total BID/RFP;

%

If additional space is required for your subcontractor listing, make copies of this form and submit with you bid package.

This page must be completed sad uploaded to DemandStar.com with your Submittal.
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i, PROJECT ATION (city and smee)
FDOT T2768 Gainesvﬂln,FL 262

HRIEF DESCRIPTION (Beief scope, size, costs, etc) and SPECIFIC ROLE DiCheck if project campleted with cazrent fiem
Paving SR26 & SW 34th St- Project Manager and Supeintendeat

2. BROJECT ! (city snd stat)  PEARCOMPLETED
918-790. Gainesville, FL, 2020

A 1 O

BRIE RI ief scope, oi , etc) and SPECIFICROLE  [¥Check i pro eted with cuereat firm
Lo%_gsdq,ai;{m@gfmpe,ﬂmm &smmem [XCheck if project camspleted with currens
construction of Project No. 918-7905, NW 122nd Strect and State Road 26

Intersection Modifications  Project MGR

L o PROJE AL LB AND LOCATIC ity and gt T o o YEAR COMPLETED
!;P“”ec: 37901 N Aoty ﬁc@omyﬂ ‘i N }
BRIEF DESCRIPTION (Brief scope, size, costs, etc.) and SPECIFIC ROLE (XCheck if project completed with curme current firm

A— BLOCATION Gy s i compLEED—
Celebration Pointe - Gainesville FI. o

5. PROJECT TITLE AND LOCATION ity and sttg) "_“r'\rm_;:gmm.émp N

BRIEF DESCRIPTION (Brief scope, size, costs, ctr.) and SPECIFIC ROLE DiCheck if project completed with cutrent firm

. PROIECT TITLE AND LOCATION (city and state)

WE o —_— ——— — e
URIEF D} SCRIPTIQN (Brief scope, size, costs, etc.) and SPECIFIC ROLE  [DICheck if project completed with current firm |
| |

This page must pe completed and uploaded to DemandStat.cam with your Suhmnjtte!
MdﬁgDamem-m-Savi:u-Pagemofm



CUSTOMER HISTORY
Name of Bidder: Watson Construction Company L1.C

Mahdmmmmmmmtmmmmmmm . Copy form
as necessary.

e aa e -

t Add:ess B 2379BcvﬂlcRoad
Cuy s:m,an Daytona Beach,FL 32119 R o
Point of Contact:  Steve Bovid i mme Nmbe,. 352-213-9422
E-mail;

;CnstomuName. Celebmnonl’amucﬂoldmgs,u.c
“ﬂ;‘es’;." T BBSWeIh D T T

City, State, Zip: Gainesville, FL 32608 e
Point of Contact; Svein Dyrkolboth ] Phone Number: 352-258-1572
E-mail:

Customer Name: FDOT

| Address: 605 Suwaanee Street
City, Sate, Zip:  Tallahassee, FI. 32399
Point of Contact  Kevin W..-oner ! Phone Number: 352-281-6857
E-maijl:

Customes Name:  Alachus Connty Pablic Works

e e A2 e o e i s T T

Address: 5620 NW 120th Lene |
City, State, Zip: Gainesvill,FL 32653

. Point ofComcc Tim McKenzie - Phone Number:  352-231.4950

li Cusuomet Name:
Addtess:

i th, Sme, Zip:
i Point of Contact: Phone Number:

,E—mail:

Lot — —_—

This page must be com ted sad uploaded to DensndStar.com with your Submitnl,
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RESPONSIBLE AGENT FORM

Dou@s Dabn
RESPONSIBLE AGENT: il
940 NW 247th Drive  Newbecry, FL 32669

ADDRESS:
PHONENo: 3524729157
352.472-2520
FAX NO: L
ug{@vwatsonconstract.
EMAIL ADDRESS: do T

ALTERNATE RESPONSIBLE AGENT: Joni Walsh Durden

ADDRESS: 940 NW 247th Drive Newberry,FL 32669
PHONENO, J32-437-2224

T2
FAXNO: >47122520

EMAIL ADDRESS: B _;iwalsh@waﬁm:ncousm:m:.com

This page must be completed sad uploaded to DemandStes.com with
applies to bidder,

your Sabmittel, if the Living Wage Ordinsace
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— WATSCON-01 __8E HILTS
o e o CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE - ¥ smiry

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder Is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED pravisions or be endorsed.
i SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an ondorsement. A statament on
this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lisu of such endorsementis).

PRODUCER | §2M7A°T Shirley Hill Shilts ) =
AssuredPartnors, Galnesville FHONE e (352) 378-2511 | % voy:(352) 378-9801
mﬁ% Sigegiied fmm.snms@muredpanne&m
| INSURERSAFFORDINGCOVERAGE | nacs

ey - ) | msurer A : Clncinnati Insurance Company - 10677
INSURED INBURERB:
‘ Watson Construction Company LLC WNguRERCG: 000000000

840 NW 247 Drive INSURERD : e E—

Hovliery;FE 32562 |msuReRe: oV o
. B i | msuRERF: | j
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO GERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD

INDIGATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT YITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT YO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.
ADDUBUBR] o ior momeeer | POLCY POLICY e
o] TYPE OF INSURANCE Bl POLICY NUMBER ) | ey EXE LamTS
A | X | COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY EACHOCCURRENCE |8 1,000,000
| cuamsanoe [X] occur EPPOG0STTS 212012022 | 2/20/2023 | GAETORENTED LT T 500,000
| MED EXP (Any one person) | § 10,000
] personaLsanveuury | 1,000,000
| GENL AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERALAGBREGATE |5 4000,000
| poucy ARG Loc PRODUCTE-COMPIOPAGG | ¢ 2/000,000
oTHER: |- R _ ER |s 3,000,000
A | ayromomiE eIy OMBNEOSWGLELMT |, 1,000,000
L ANY AUTO | EPP0605779 212012022 | 22012023 | popuy INJURY (Per persony | §
| RNSR oy | FygRue | BODLLY INJURY (Per accigent;| $ _
|| AR oy GRE | | TR |
A | X | vwareia s Ili oceuR - N EcHoccURRENCE |3 5,000,000
EXCESSLAB | I_[CLAIMS-MADE EPP0605779 2202022 | 22002023 | ,ccorcare s 6,000,000
oo [X[rerenmons O - e $
A ERPLOYERS: DIASR Ty . | [ [T
A PROPIETORPARTIEREXECUTVE [ | EL. EACH ACCIDENT s
i deserbem;cr | EL DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE $ —
| OESERIFTION OF OPERATIONS beiow L __li EL. DISEASE - POLIGY LIMIT | s

DESCHP“WOFOP;AMNSIMMNSIMLES WMMMMW&MMMHMWBW

J

'CERTIFICATE HOLDER e CANCELLATION I
| SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED N
City of Gainesville ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.
P O Box 480
MS 58 e — -
Gainesville, FL 32617-0490 | AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE |

Lol |
© 1988-2015 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights ressrved.
The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD

-

ACORD 25 (2016/03)



6/20/22, 12:22 PM Letter View

Jimmy Patroais Jokn Gatiin
CHIEF FINANCIAL OFFICER BUREAU CHIEF
Julius Halas Catherine Thrasher
DIVISION PIRECTOR £ # SAFETY PROGRAM MANAGER
e
FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES

DIVISION OF STATE FIRE MARSHAL
200 EAST GAINES STREET - Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0342
Tel. 850-413-3644

CERTIFICATE OF COMPETENCY
OFFICIAL COPY
THIS CERTIFIES THAT: Douglas H Dabney
940 NW 247th Drive
Newberry FL 32669

-BUSINESS ORGANIZATION: Watson Constraction Company, LLC

Contractor V means a contractor whose business is limited to the execution of contracts requiring the ability to
fabricate, install, inspect, alter, repair and service the underground piping for a fire protection system using water
as the extinguishing agent beginning at the point of service as defined in the act and ending no more than 1 foot
above the finished floor,

Issue Date: 07/01/2022
Type: 09

Class: 14

County: Alachua
License/Permit #: FPC21-000105
Expiration Date: 06/30/2024

Chief Financial Officer

file:/IC/UssrsiwittiDownloads/License_Permit - 2022-06-20T1 22250.912.htm m
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D’
ACOR

CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER,

IMPORTANT: If the certificate hiolder Is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the
¥ SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject fo the terms and conditions of

poficy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
the policy, certaln policies may require an endorsement. A statement on

this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder In lleu of such endorsement(s).

PRODUCER TR Jacquie Monroe
Arthur J. Gallagher Risk Management Services, Inc. %“‘gm‘“‘““ T - IF‘Ex -
4350 W Cypress St Suite 300 PEho e T2TTO76250 | (AR ey e
Tampa FL 25607 Adwss: CerRequests@ajgeom

- _INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE  __ | wace
L - . Wiscong| WEURERA: Zenith Insurance Company | 43069
INSURED WATSCONO1| |0 ien -7
Watson Construction Company, LLC — . l- =
940 NW 247th Drive BISURERG: N S— = |-
Newberry FL 32669 msURERD: -

INSURERE : i

INSURER F
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: 1695788367 REVISION NUMBER:

EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES.

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANGCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS

.3 TYPE OF INSURANCE Jr-=yi-vyl POUCY NUMBER MRDOI YY) | etneey | LTS
| COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY ’ | | EACH OCCURRENCE $
- DAWAGETORERTED ™ -
MED BXP (Ary s persry | 8
e PERSONAL SADV INAURY  |§
| SEN'. AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: BENERAL AGGREGATE _ ,Tg__‘
L rouor [ ]88 [ uee PRODUCTS - COMPIOP AGG | 5 .
|| omiEr '$
“COMBINED SINGLE LT
| AUTOMOBAE LiASILITY |{Fmgodkdenyy |8
| !mvwro BODILY INJURY (Per parsan} | §
| | Amosomy | |5 j_wumﬁw&uy; .
 Adsomy } | Aros oy {Per accident) —
{ $
1 i g
_jumeRaLALAS | oo | enciocourrence |5
|Excessuas | | cuamsamane | AGGREGATE $
e ey e | CLAME A EASGREGATE
{oep |1 revenmions P s
A WORKERS COMPENBATION I
oy AT on | Zi3seatsoy viezs | o X TBEGT GF f“"' e
; ANYPROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE o EL EACHACCIENT ~ _!$1,000000
| in N ‘ i | E:L DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE, $ 1,000,000
O e B o ERATIONS befow | EL DiseasE - poLicy uwr | $ 1,000,000

|

OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES 101, Additional

DESCRIFTION {AGORD 1011, Remarks Schedeje, may be attachad if mote space is required)
Excluded officer-Douglas H. Dabney (managing member), Tammy Dabney {managing member)

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

CANCELLATION

City of Gainesville

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WitL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROWISIONS.

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

7’% ' D’ﬁ#ﬂ «”

ACORD 25 (2016/03)

© 1988-2015 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights ressrved.

The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD



Ron DeSantes. Gsovernar Melanie S Grffin Secretary

dbjer
STATE OF FLORIDA

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL REGULATION

CONSTRUCTION INDUSTRY LICENSING BOARD

THE UNDERGROUND UTILITY & EXCAVATION CO HEREIN IS CERTIFIED UNDER THE
PROVISIONS OF CHAPTER 489, FLORIDA STATUTES

DABNEY, DOUGLAS HALE

WATSON CONSTRUCTION COMPANY, LLC
940 NW 247TH DRIVE
NEWBERRY FL 32669

LICENSE NUMBER: CUC1225043

EXPIRATION DATE: AUGUST 31, 2024
Always verify licenses onfine at MyFloridaLicense.com

Do not alter this document in any form.

This Is your license. It is unfawful for anyone other than the licensee to use this document.




Ron DeSantis, Governot Melanie § Griffin, Secretary

dbjer
STATE OF FLORIDA

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL REGULATION

CONSTRUCTION INDUSTRY LICENSING BOARD

THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR HEREIN IS CERTIFIED UNDER THE
PROVISIONS OF CHAPTER 489, FLORIDA STATUTES

DABNEY, DOUGLAS HALE

WATSON CONSTRUCTION COMPANY, LLC
940 NW 247TH DRIVE
NEWBERRY FL 32649

ICENSE NUMBER: CGC1510498

EXPIRATION DATE: AUGUST 31, 2024
Always verify licenses onfine at MyFloridalicense.com

Do not alter this document in any form,

This is your license. it is unlawful for anyone other than the licensee to use this document.



Farm Lﬂt’" = 5’} | Request for Taxmyer Give Form to the

(Rev. October 2018) - Identification Number and Certification requester. Do not

mﬂw:u?&m ! b&bmﬁmy]ﬁmlﬂﬁrhﬁuﬁmmmmm L to the ms.

o 'Tm_immmw_mummtwmmﬂhmwmmmhm - ) .
'Watson Construction Company,LLC v

' Biirean—NCTON { = ook o s

| [} Other fson instructions) » s e S e | Phovtes
& Addnoes frumber, e, stroet, and apt. or sulte 16 Ses Tnstructions, " ‘ | P
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6 City, atats, and ZIP code

or i
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Cortification

Under penalties of pequry, | certity that: -
;.inbudmmmﬁrmbmycmwwqrrmﬁmnmmubﬂmwuﬂngforalummlobebwedtome);n:u
'mmm?mwmwmzaMWmemu%%mwwhIﬂsbvf::noﬁﬁedmalhatlam
mmmhmﬁwm

s.lunau.s.cﬂlmnuroﬂnru.s.pum(dmabahw):m

you have fallad to report ff intorsat on your tax retum. For real mmemmm.mmwm
acquisition or ebandonment of sacured of contributiona to an individua) (RA), , PERyMonts
mmmumMmMmmwmmmmmmmmms@mmmmuw
Sign Signatro m..'  Durd Dty aga by et Wkt

Here U,s;.plm:'b e - S Date d

Genera' lnmc“ons 'm1mmmmmmwm

mm“bmmmmmm .m1mmmdmmm,mm
noted. proceads)

Future For the latest Information about M
| mh el "‘ml Fum1mgmw:wmmwmmwm

mﬂwmpubhud.wtom.fmgovlﬁsmm * Form 1080-8 § 15 from real eetat tone)
Pumose of Form -Fm1m«mmnmmmmmwm
An individual or en {Form W-8 requester) who Is required to file an -Fam1maﬂnmenmwam1mmmmum
mwmmmmmmWWW 1088-T (usition)

mmmwmmmmwmm * Form 1099-C (canceled debl)
EN), to lnmso(nmm';me i Tl .UaeF:lnnW-Bomylf u us. dmm
INJ, on an retum the amount other you sre person a
MN) wreport mmmmmmmmpffmmwmq alien), 1o provide your comect T,
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'Form1099-NT(lmanslemndorpdd) WMWM&WIGWWM@
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FECETEE TS S s I e e R IS e = .

CI'TY UF NEWBERRY
25440 W Newberry Rd, Newberry, FL 32669-0369
LOCAL BUSINESS TAX

Issued: September 30, 2022 License # 0250.1
Expires: September 30, 2023 Fee Paid: $162.00

Business Name/Address Local Business Tax Issued To:
WATSON CONSTRUCTION COMPANY WATSON CONSTRUCTION COMPANY

OFFICE 840 NW 247TH DR
940 NW 247TH DR NEWBERRY FL 32669-2545

NEWBERRY FL 32669-2545
ity S Bice
Business y

CONTRACTORS CITY CLERK

NOTE: This Local Business Tax is not transferable, POST lN A CONSPICUOUS PLACE.
This Local %usmess Talxn bescomes anrecelpts;)nly t‘iien properly dated an

CITY OF NEWBERRY
el 25440 W Newberry Rd, Newberry, FL 32669-0369
"™ LOCAL BUSINESS TAX

Issued: September 30, 2022 License # 0250.1
Expires: September 30, 2023 Fee Paid: $162.00

Business Name/Address Local Business Tax Issued To:

WATSON CONSTRUCTION COMPANY WATSON CONSTRUCTION COMPANY
OFFICE 940 NW 247TH DR
840 NW 247TH DR NEWBERRY FL 32689-2545

NEWBERRY FL 32669-2545
Tl S Bze
Buasiness Type: b

CONTRACTORS CITY CLERK

NOTE: This Lacal Business Tax is not !ransferable POST IN A CONSPICUOUS PLACE.
This Local Business Tax becomes a receipt onl y when properly dated and signed.

e e =T et G — il



1/30/23, 1:.57 PM Detail by Entity Name

DivisioN OF CORPORATIONS

.c:rg IR

ar vrife foal aped v v f

Dep nment of State / Divislon of Comgrations / Search Records / Search by Entity Name /

Detail by Entity Name

Florida Limited Liability Gompany

WATSON CONSTRUCTION COMPANY, LLC
Filing Information

Document Number 108000014232
FEVEIN Number 80-0219140
Date Filed 02/07/2008
State FL

Status ACTIVE

Last Event LC NAME CHANGE
Event Date Filed 12/31/2012

Event Effective Date NONE

Principal Address

940 NW 247TH DR
NEWBERRY, F1. 32669
Mailing Address

940 NW 247THDR
NEWBERRY, FL 32669

Changed: 01/08/2011
Registered Agent Name & Address

DABNEY, DOUGLAS H
940 NW 247TH DR
NEWBERRY, FL 32669

Name Changed: 04/08/2020

Address Changed: 01/08/2011

Authorized Person(s) Detall
Name & Address

Title Authorized Member
DABNEY, TAMMY

940 NW 247TH DRIVE
NEWBERRY, FL 32669

https:llseamh.sunbiz.orgllnquirleorporaﬁonSearchlSearchResuItDetaiI?inquirytype=Enﬁlmene&directionType#niﬁal&searchNameOrder:WATSON... 12



1130723, 1:57 PM
Title Authorized Member

DABNEY, DOUGLAS H

940 NW 247TH DRIVE
NEWBERRY, FL 32669
Annual Reports

Report Year Flled Date
2020 04/08/2020
2021 04/27/2021
2022 04/05/2022
Document Images

04/05/2022 - ANNUAL REPORT

04/2772021 —- ANNUAL REPORT
04/08/2020 - ANNUAL REPORT

04/18/2019 -- ANNUAL REPOXT

04/04/2018 . ANNLAL REPORT

04/06/2017 — ANNI:AL REPORT

04/13/2016 ~ ANNUAL REPORT

04/29/2015 - ANN AL REPORT
04/22/2014 - ANNUAL REPORT
04/25/2013 -- ANNUAL REPORT
12312012 — L.C Name Changg

04/26/2 12 - ANNUAL REPORT
01/08/2011 — ANNUAL REPORT
04/30/2010 -- ANNUAL REPO-T

04/30/2009 — ANNUA.. REPORT
02/07/2008 — Florida Limited Liability

hupszllsearch.sunblz.urgllnquiryICorporationSearchISearchResultDetail?inquirytype=EntityName&diracﬁonType=lniﬁal&seard1Nam0rder=WATSON... 2/2

View image in PDF format
View image in PDF formst
View image in PDF format
View imags in P;‘format
View image in PDF format
View image in PDF format
View image in PDF format
View image in PDF format
View image In PDF format
Viaw image in POF format
View image in PDF format
View image in PDF format
View image in PDF format
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